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ABSTRACT 
Nowadays, competitive market creates the necessity of quality improvement at different levels of supply 
chains (SCs). This paper contributes to the SC coordination literature and proposes a bilateral 
wholesale price (BWP) contract for optimizing pricing and quality improvement decisions in different 
echelons of a cell phone SC. The SC comprises a manufacturer who deals with determining the product 
quality and a retailer who seeks an optimal strategy for price, after-sales service, and service level in a 
periodic review inventory system. First, the decentralized model is investigated, where each member 
makes decisions individually. Afterwards, a benchmark is obtained for the whole system optimality 
through centralization. To convince the members to choose the benchmark decisions, the BWP 
contract is proposed and is shown to be capable of simultaneous coordination of the decisions. The 
analyses showed that in a market which is sensitive to quality, service, and price, the application of 
BWP facilitates greater investing in such quality improvements while the members’ profitability is 
guaranteed in comparison to the traditional case. Moreover, this application can increase the SC 
service level, since it enables the members to hold more safety stock even under high inventory costs. 
Overall, the proposed coordination model for pricing, quality, after-sales service, and service level 
leads to the optimal performance of the SC and its members while it is beneficial for the customers. 
 
KEYWORDS: Quality improvement, Supply chain coordination, Pricing, Service, Periodic review 
inventory system, Bilateral wholesale price contract. 
 

1. Introduction1 
Supply Chain (SC) is a set of entities connected 
with streams of materials from upstream entities 
to downstream ones and financial and 
information flow from downstream entities to 
upstream ones. One of the main indicators of the 
effectiveness of this system is the level of 
demand that the SC faces. In today’s market, 
product price, product quality, after-sales service, 
promotional efforts, etc. are the well-known 
factors that affect product demand. Moreover, the 
percentage of customers whose demands are met 
within a given period (i.e., the service level of the 
SCs) can be another important indicator of the 
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system performance in the market. Analyzing 
such factors and proper management of the 
related operations, especially in the competitive 
markets with stochastic demands, can have great 
impacts on the success of the SC business. Proper 
management of these systems highly depends on 
the interactions between the entities within the 
system. Generally, many decisions in the SCs, 
especially those related to product price, product 
quality, and services, are made individually by 
each SC entity. Each entity’s decision on one of 
these factors may either positively or negatively 
affect the others’ profitability. One approach to 
improving this individual decision-making 
structure is considering the whole SC viewpoint 
so as to achieve a globally optimal performance. 
However, such a consideration may not result in 
mutual profits of the SC members. In fast-
changing markets, the relationship among the 
firms is becoming closer. Thus, to improve all 
members’ profit and achieve mutually beneficial 
goals and the globally optimal performance of the 
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SCs, a coordination mechanism can play a critical 
role in generating such outcomes [1]. The 
necessity of applying a coordination model is 
much more realized when considering such 
interdependent decisions as retailers’ services, 
inventory replenishment, product quality, and 
service level improvement, which can determine 
the level of a qualified SC. For the coordination 
purposes, many contracts are developed in the 
related literature, such as discount ([2], [3], [4], 
[59]), credit period contract ([5], [6]), two-part 
tariff contract ([60],[61]), collaborative models 
([7], [8], [9]), cost sharing ([10], [11], [12]), and 
combined contracts ([62]). Product quality 
denotes a set of product features, more of which 
increase consumer product price and also 
marginal costs [13]. Putting product price aside, 
product quality plays the most important role in 
consumers' purchasing behaviors [46]. Some of 
the most well-known companies, such as Tylenol, 
Coca-Cola, Starbucks, and Porsche invest in their 
product quality in order to guarantee the best 
possible service or product received by the 
customers [58]. Besides product quality, service 
level is another competitive decision in today’s 
market [48], which can bring customers’ 
satisfaction [47]. Since the similarity of the 
products is increasing, it is a notable issue for the 
firms to enhance their differentiation from other 
competitors by investing in service efforts such 
as repairing, upgrading products over many 
years, and providing pre-sales services and after-
sales services [20]. Between these services, the 
last one belongs to a set of most prominent 
factors, which keep customers and their 
satisfaction with products. In other words, after-
sales service is a strategy for firms to promote 
their competitiveness [20]. For example, Apple 
Inc. provides after-sales services through its 
retailers by considering wholesale price contracts 
for them. Samsung also considers such services, 
mostly through its authorized downstream. 
Amazon, an online retailer, provides insurance 
services, called “Amazon Prime.” Suning, a 
Chinese electronic product retailer, is presenting 
after-sales services for customers [21]. Services 
are costly for their providers and a longer service 
period increases this cost [17]. However, 
customers prefer products with more extended 
service periods. Hence, it is important to 
determine a desirable level of investment in 
services. In recent years, among SC owners, 
optimizing inventory, decreasing operating 
expenses, and improving service levels are 
becoming more popular points [24]. The safety 

stock is an acute factor in the uncertain situation, 
which specifies the SC service level [25]. Service 
level is described as an amount of demand, which 
is met by the retailer in a determined period [25] 
and positively affects the SC performance in 
competitive environments. Besides, the 
improvement of the service level can change the 
pricing strategies [26]. On the other hand, Liu et 
al. suggested that, under certain situations, the 
increased service level reduces the total service 
capacity [26]. Since the service level mitigates 
the impacts of unexpected events, it is necessary 
to set an inventory level according to the 
additional safety stock [27]. The low level of 
safety stock leads to shortage on the retailer side 
and reduces all members’ market share [28] 
while additional safety stock terminates 
additional costs [25]. Therefore, upstream 
members make their efforts to convince the 
downstream ones to improve the service level 
and, in turn, mitigate shortage risks [29]. 
Generally, in decentralized SCs, the downstream 
member (e.g., retailer) specifies the safety stock 
level, while, in reality, this affects upstream 
member's profit, as well. Thus, the coordination 
of such decisions is very critical. The problem in 
the current study is investigated based on the 
challenges of a real case study related to a cell 
phone SC, where a manufacturer sells his product 
via a retailer. In the highly competitive market of 
cell phones, among a wide variety of cell phone 
types, one of the most important issues that the 
manufacturer deals with is the quality of its 
product. The retailer of this SC faces handling the 
service level and pricing, which are the other 
determining factors of the business success. Such 
decisions as the product quality, service, and 
price highly depend on each other; thus, lack of a 
proper scheme for integrated decision-making on 
these issues causes a financial problem for the 
company and leads to conflicts between the 
decision-makers in the current situation of the 
company. For instance, considering a high-
qualified service for a product with a low-quality 
level results in high costs for the retailer, while it 
increases the product demand. Therefore, finding 
an effective method for making these decisions in 
an integrated manner in order to both reduce the 
conflicts and maintain the positive effects of 
them on demand is of high importance for the 
company. The current structure of decision-
making in this SC is decentralized, where both 
the manufacturer and retailer decide separately 
with the aim of optimizing their own 
performance regardless of each other’s profits. 
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On the other side, a centralized structure 
(integrated structure) leads to losses for one of 
the members. Accordingly, the company seeks a 
proper management strategy to resolve the 
challenges of finding an optimal decision-making 
structure for such interdependent decisions in 
order to reduce the conflicts between the 
decision-makers in determining quality, pricing, 
service level, and after-sales service decisions. 
Motivated by the challenges of the above real 
case and according to the research gaps, the 
current paper contributes to the literature on SC 
coordination by finding optimal decisions on 
pricing, after-sales service, quality, and service 
levels so that both the entire SC and its members' 
performance are optimized. More precisely, this 
study investigates decisions related to SC quality 
improvement at two levels of the SC. To find the 
optimal decisions, three different decision-
making models are investigated and, finally, a 
coordination model is proposed to apply a 
bilateral wholesale price to convince the SC 
members to give up single decision-making and 
accept the centralized structure, which results in 
the global optimum for the whole system’s 
performance and its members. In the next section, 
proper description of the real case problem under 
investigation is represented. After that, in Section 
3, the decentralized, centralized, and coordinated 
structures are modeled. Section 4 represents the 
model evaluation based on the case data. Finally, 
Section 5 provides conclusions of the paper and 
some suggestions for future research. 
 

2. Literature Review 
In this section, the related literature is reviewed 
considering quality improvement in the SC along 
with service and periodic review inventory 
decisions.Studying quality decisions along with 
pricing and other related decisions in supply 
chains (SCs), where each decision is made by the 
corresponding entity regardless of the other 
entities’ profit, has gained academics’ attention 
and practitioners. For instance, Ma et al. 
considered the demand as a function of quality, 
price, and promotional efforts and proposed a 
combined coordination contract for finding their 
optimal values [14]. Seifbarghy et al. applied a 
revenue-sharing policy for calculating the best 
decisions on pricing and quality within a two-
echelon SC [15]. Jerath et al. studied the 
interchange of quality, inventory, pricing, and 
vertical channel interactions [13]. Yoo and 
Cheong studied quality enhancement through 
reward policies offered by a buyer to a supplier 

and investigated the effects of this strategy on SC 
operations [16]. Hosseini-Motlagh et al. proposed 
a coordination contract to find the optimal 
amounts of quality along with competitive 
warranty decisions [17]. Zhang et al. studied the 
relations between an upstream member’s quality 
decisions and the downstream member’s 
selection of revenue-sharing mechanisms [18]. In 
a study by Sarkar et al., quality improvement and 
safety factor were imported into their model as 
dependent variables, while they were directly 
influenced by customer satisfaction [19]. Li et al. 
considered a two-echelon supply chain, where the 
supplier offered core components with a certain 
quality level to the downstream manufacturer 
[49]. They investigated optimal pricing and 
quality decisions considering fairness preferences 
of the members and their bargaining powers. 
These studies have all studied quality 
improvement in the production level along with 
pricing and inventory decisions. Besides the 
product quality, after-sales service is another 
important factor that affects product demand and 
is interlinked with the product quality decisions 
[17]. From a theoretical viewpoint, investigating 
service decisions in SCs and finding the optimal 
amount of investment in services have become 
more popular in recent years. Habibi and Tarokh 
investigated competition among two service 
providers offering the same web service in which 
a monopoly service provider offered a 
complementary service to their services. Each 
provider decided on service level and pricing for 
the service level  [50]. Wu investigated a SC 
including two manufacturers bundling their 
products with services (warranty and 
advertisement) and a retailer that sold the 
products and decided on the sales price [51]. Li et 
al. proposed a service commitment policy in a 
manufacturer-retailer system, and showed that a 
cost-sharing strategy can enhance their profits 
[20]. Wei et al. investigated the best strategies for 
pricing and warranty service under four different 
game structures [22]. Rezapour et al. developed 
an integrated model for designing an effective 
production schedule and determined the optimal 
service level and after-sales service [23]. Dan et 
al. studied warranty service decision of a 
manufacturer in a dual-channel SC consisting of 
a manufacturer and a retailer that competed on 
offering free value-added service to customers 
[52]. Xia et al. examined service-level and 
distribution channel decisions for two competing 
SCs with a focus on how service competition 
affected the channel structure [53]. Although 
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these studies have considered optimization of 
service decisions in SC systems, studies 
considering service decisions along with quality 
and pricing decisions are scarce; for instance, 
Yuen and Chan investigated the impact of the 
retailer’s service level and product quality on 
customers loyalty [54]. Modak et al. considered 
optimization of warranty service period, pricing, 
and quality decisions under the decentralized and 
centralized models [55]. Hosseini-Motlagh et al. 
proposed the optimization of warranty service 
and green quality under a competitive situation 
[17]. Similar to these studies, this study aims to 
optimize service and quality decisions; however, 
different from them, this study considers 
simultaneous coordination of pricing, service, 
and quality decisions while considering the effect 
of service level decisions under a periodic review 
inventory system. Replenishment decision of a 
SC member is one of the factors that affects the 
responsiveness and performance of the SC and 
needs to be coordinated [42]. In comparison with 
other inventory systems, under the periodic 
review inventory systems, there is a need to hold 
more safety stock in order to increase the service 
level of the SC [56]. This imposes costs on the 
system. Accordingly, the optimization of safety 
stock decisions has attracted the attention of 
academia in recent years. Johari et al. coordinated 
pricing and periodic review inventory decisions 
(i.e., safety stock and review period) using a 
quantity discount coordination model [30]. In 
another study, Johari et al. proposed a 
coordination model based on different modes of 
transportation for coordinating review period, 
safety stock, and pricing [31]. Nematollahi et al. 
proposed the coordination of a two-level 
pharmaceutical SC and service level by applying 
a multi-objective collaborative decision-making 
structure, in which visit interval of the pharma-
distributor specified the review period duration of 
the pharma-retailer’s inventory method [8]. 
Hosseini-Motlagh et al. investigated the 
coordination of periodic review replenishment 
decisions along with advertising in a competitive 
situation [32]. They showed that the coordination 
model reduced the risks of such decisions even 
under competition. Hosseini-Motlagh et al. 
explored coordination among the members of a 
two-echelon socially responsible SC with 
promotional effort, corporate social 
responsibility, and periodic review replenishment 
decisions [10]. In order to optimize inventory 
policies, using periodic-review base-stock policy, 
Sakulsom and Tharmmaphornphilas proposed a 

two-phase heuristic method by which the first 
phase involved determining the initial ordering 
policy and the second phase involved 
determining the safety stock [57]. Similar to these 
studies, the current study aims to optimize safety 
stock decision in a periodic review system by 
considering safety stock as a decision variable. 
However, the aim of this study is to optimize this 
decision variable along with other factors that 
affect the quality of services in the SCs, i.e., 
service and quality decisions.A summary of the 
reviewed literature is provided in Table 1. Based 
on the reviewed literature, one can conclude that 
the simultaneous coordination of quality, pricing, 
after-sales service, and service level, which are 
interrelated decisions, has not yet been 
investigated. Although the optimization of each 
single decision, or at most two of the three 
decisions, has been considered in the previous 
literature, for instance, Ma et al., Seifbarghy et 
al., Jerath et al., Mai et al., Yoo and Cheong, and 
Zhang et al., which have coordinated quality and 
pricing decisions [14],[15],[13],[33],[16],[18] and 
Hosseini-Motlagh et al. who have investigated 
the coordination of quality and service decisions 
[17], these studies have not considered 
coordination of quality, pricing, and service 
decisions simultaneously. Moreover, most of the 
papers in the context of SC quality improvement 
(e.g., [14], [16], and [18]) have considered 
improvements in the production level (i.e., 
product quality improvement); however, one can 
consider SC quality improvement in other layers 
of the SC, as well. To be more precise, the 
service level and after-sales services can be other 
signs of the quality of SC performance. 
Accordingly, the optimization of service level 
and after-sales services has been widely 
considered in the previous literature (as in [50], 
[20], and [8]). However, they all have considered 
the quality improvement in one layer of the SC, 
i.e., production or sales level and not 
simultaneously in both layers. Moreover, 
regarding the service level improvement in the 
periodic review inventory systems, to the best of 
our knowledge, only Nematollahi et al. 
investigated the coordination of service level 
decisions [29],[8]; however, they have not 
considered the coordination of these decision 
along with other important factors as price, 
quality, and, service decisions, which the current 
study aims to do. 
Overall, based on the above research gaps, the 
main contributions of this paper can be expressed 
as follows: (a) proposing SC quality 
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improvement in two levels of the SC, i.e., 
production level and sales level, simultaneously; 
(b) developing a bilateral wholesale price 
contract to simultaneously coordinate pricing, 
quality, after-sales service, and service level 
within a periodic review inventory system. 
 

3. Problem Definition 
This paper considers the challenges of a real case 
of a two-echelon cell phone supply chain (SC), 
including a manufacturer and a retailer, namely 
MEC and CLPH, respectively. Due to 
confidentiality reasons, these artificial names are 
chosen for the SC members. In the investigated 
case study, MEC produces a new type of cell 
phone, and the competitive market of the cell 
phone makes it critical for MEC to consider the 
quality level of this product. MEC sells its cell 
phones in the market through CLPH. CLPH 
decides on the price, after-sales service, and 
service level of this cell phone. To reduce 
shortages, it is important for CLPH to increase its 
service level in the market. It applies a periodic 
review inventory system for its replenishment 
decisions and needs to determine the optimal 
decision on safety stock in this system, which is a 
determining factor of its service level. CLPH 
places orders at constant intervals to MEC and 
receives orders after a constant lead time. Since 
lead time does not exceed the length of inventory 
review interval, there is always no more than one 
order in each cycle. The shortages on the CLPH 
side are fully backordered. However, it tends to 
increase its service level to remain competitive in 
the market. MEC invests in SC quality 
improvement at the production level, and CLPH 
considers SC quality improvement strategies at 
the sales level.Considering a higher quality level 
or providing a qualified service for the customers 
has benefits for both MEC and CLPH, as well as 
the whole SC, since it increases demand. 
However, only the corresponding decision-maker 
incurs the costs of such decisions. In the current 
situation, MEC and CLPH individually determine 
the optimal level of their decisions so that their 
own profitability is optimized. This kind of 
decision-making does not necessarily lead to the 
best performance of the entire SC. This is due to 
the fact that product quality, service, and price 
are interrelated decisions, and the current 
decision-making structure of the SC ignores such 
an interrelation. This, in turn, may cause the SC 
to miss a great amount of marginal profit. For 
instance, if the cell phone produced by MEC is 
not of high quality and CLPH offers a long 

service period and a high price for this product, 
this not only leads to high service cost for CLPH, 
but also has negative effects on the company's 
credibility in the market. On the other hand, if 
CLPH holds little amounts of safety stock, due to 
the fact that the market demand is stochastic, its 
service level may become low in the market, 
which reduces MEC's profit, as well. Overall, a 
challenge for the whole company is to maintain 
its market share in the competitive situation and 
find the optimal quality improvement strategy at 
different levels of its SC. Another challenge is to 
find a proper decision-making structure to 
determine the optimal values of pricing, quality, 
after-sales service, and safety stock level in such 
a way that both MEC and CLPH profits, as well 
as the whole SC's profit, are optimized.To resolve 
the company's challenges, in this paper, three 
different structures of decision-making are 
investigated. First, the decentralized model in 
which MEC and CLPH decide separately to 
maximize their own profit is determined through 
a Retailer-Stackelberg game with CLPH as the 
leader and MEC as the follower. Second, the 
centralized model is investigated in which the SC 
is considered as an integrated unity with a central 
decision-maker, who determines the pricing, 
quality, after-sales service, and safety stock 
decisions with the aim of optimizing the whole 
SC profit. The centralized decisions may not 
necessarily be acceptable by MCE or CLPH. 
Thus, to convince MEC and CLPH to choose 
these decisions, a bilateral wholesale price 
(BWP) coordination mechanism is proposed. 
Afterward, to examine the model applicability, 
the model is run based on the company data, and 
a comprehensive sensitivity analysis is 
performed, as well. The notations used for the 
parameters and decisions variables are provided 
in Table 2. 
 

4. Model Formulation 
This study investigates the decentralized, 
centralized, and coordinated decision-making 
models. The optimum amounts of decision 
variables are determined under these structures. 
In the case under realization, it is assumed that 
the service level, after-sales services, and sales 
price are endogenous variables determined by the 
retailer (CLPH), and quality is the manufacturer’s 
(MEC’s) endogenous decision variable; 
therefore, according to the explanation offered by 
Chen at al. on endogenous selling prices, they are 
determined considering demand sensitivity to 
these variables [63]. 
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Tab. 1. A brief view of the reviewed literature. 
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Habibi and Tarokh 
[50]       

Deterministically 
Dependent on 

Price and  
Service quality 

   ------ ------ 

Yuen and Chan [54]       ------    ------ ------ 

Wu [51]       

Deterministically 
Dependent on 

Price and 
Service 

   ------ ------ 

Ma et al. [14]       

Deterministically 
Dependent on 

Price, marketing 
efforts, and quality 

   

Combination of 
two-part tariff and 

quality cost-sharing 
contracts 

------ 

Li et al. [20]      
 

Stochastic with IFR 
Dependent on 

retailer’s service 
level commitment. 

   Cost-sharing 
mechanism ------ 

Wei et al. [22]       
Deterministically 

Dependent on price 
and warranty 

   ------ ------ 

Seifbarghy et al. 
[15]       

Deterministically 
Dependent on price 

and quality 
   Revenue-sharing 

contract ------ 

Modak et al. [55]       
Deterministically 

Dependent on price, 
warranty, and quality 

   ------ ------ 
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Tab. 1. (continued) 
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Rezapour et al. [23]       

Stochastic 
Dependent on pre-

sales and after-sales 
service levels and 
warranty length 

   ------ Newsboy 

Jerath et al. [13]       Random variable    Wholesale price 
contract 

Newsvendor 

Johari et al [30]       Stochastic, 
Dependent on price    Quantity discount Periodic 

review 

Johari et al [31]       Stochastic, 
Dependent on price    Lead time crashing Periodic 

review 

Hosseini-Motlagh et 
al. [17] 

      

Deterministically 

Dependent on 
quality and 

competitive warranty 
services 

   

Multilateral 
compensation-based 

wholesale price 
contract 

------ 

Mai [33]      

 Deterministically 
Dependent on 
product quality 

(regarding 
probability of 

failure, value of 
usage, and repair 

cost) 

   Extended warranty 
contracts 

------ 

Yoo and Cheong 
[16]       

Deterministically 
Dependent on price 

and quality 
   Reward contracts ------ 
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Tab. 1. (continued) 
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Li et al. [49] 
      

Deterministically 
Dependent on 

Price and quality    ------ ------ 

Dan et al. [52]       

Deterministically 
Dependent on 

warranty and value-
added service 

   ------ ------ 

Hosseini-Motlagh et 
al. [10]       

Stochastically 
Dependent on social 

responsibility and 
promotional efforts 

   Cost-sharing 
contract 

periodic 
review 

Hosseini-Motlagh et 
al. [32]       

Stochastically 
Dependent on 
competitive 
advertising 

   Lead time crashing periodic 
review 

Nouri et al. [42]       

Stochastically 
Dependent on 
innovation and 

promotional efforts 
   

Compensation-
based wholesale 

price contract 

periodic 
review 

Nematollahi et al. [8]       Stochastic with 
Normal distribution    

Multi-Objective 
collaborative 

decision-making 

Periodic 
review 

Zhang et al. [18]       
Deterministically 

Dependent on quality 
and price 

   Revenue-sharing 
Fixed-fee scheme ------ 

Sarkar et al. [19]       
Stochastic 

With unknown 
distribution    ------ Continuous 

review 
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Tab. 1. (continued) 

 

Reference 

Decisions 

Demand function 

Supply chain structure 

Coordination 
mechanism 

Inventory 
system 

Pr
ic

in
g 

Q
ua

lit
y 

Se
rv

ic
e 

O
rd

er
 

Q
ua

nt
ity

 

R
ep

le
ni

sh
m

en
t i

n 
(R

,T
) 

sy
st

em
 

O
th

er
 

D
ec

en
tra

liz
ed

 

C
en

tra
liz

ed
 

C
oo

rd
in

at
ed

 

Xia et al [53]       
Deterministically 

Dependent on price 
and services 

   ------ ------ 

Sakulsom and 
Tharmmaphornphilas 

[57] 
      

Seasonal, 
deterministic in the 

first phase 
Stochastic in the 

second phase 
   ------ 

Periodic 
review 

Current study       

Stochastic with 
Normal distribution 

Dependent on quality, 
price, and service 

   

Bilateral wholesale 
price contract Periodic 

review 
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4-1. Decentralized 
In the decentralized structure, each supply chain 
(SC) member only cares about his/her own 
benefit optimization without considering the 
other members’ benefit [34], [35]. To model this 
structure, a game-theory approach is used, 
because CLPH's decisions affect MEC’s 
decisions. This is due to [36], which mentions 
that the game theory is used in a situation that the 
decision of each player influences that of other 
players. Since CLPH is more powerful in the 
market than MEC, a Stackleberg pattern (as in 
[45]) is used, in which CLPH and MEC are the 
leader and the follower, respectively. To solve 
the game model, backward induction is applied. 
Accordingly, at first, MEC's problem is solved by 
considering CLPH's decisions on price, service 
level, and after-sales service, leading to a primary 
 .௠, which is MEC’s response to these decisionsݍ
 
4-1-1. Manufacturer (MEC) model 
The profit function of MEC under the 
decentralized model is: 
 
(௠ݍ)௠ߨ = ݓ) − ଴ܦ)(ܿ + ௠ݍߙ + ௥ݏߚ − (௥݌ߠ −
௩
௡்
− ଵ

ଶ
௠ݍߛ 	ଶ −

ℎ௠ ቂ
(஽బାఈ௤೘ାఉ௦ೝିఏ௣ೝ)்

ଶ
ቃ ቂ(஽బାఈ௤೘ାఉ௦ೝିఏ௣ೝ)

௉ோ
(2 −

݊)+ (݊ − 1)ቃ           (1) 
 
The first term in the above equation is the 
revenue for MEC and next terms include setup 
cost per period, cost of quality investment, and 
holding cost, respectively. MEC uses a lot-for-lot 
policy for its replenishment purpose, in which the 
production multiplier ݊  is constant and 
deterministic. The holding cost is adopted from 
Joglekar [37], which represents the average 
inventory as ஽்

ଶ
[஽
௉
(2 − ݊) + (݊ − 1)] , and the 

cost of quality investment is adopted from [14].  
Proposition 1. MEC’s profit function is concave 
over ݍ௠ and the primary amount of ݍ௠ is: 
 
 
௠௣௥௜௠௔௥௬ݍ =
ఈ൤(௪ି௖)ି௛௠ቂ(ଶି௡) ೅ುೃ(ୈబାஒ௦ೝି஘୮ೝ)ା

౐(౤షభ)
మ

ቃ൨

ఊା௛௠൤(ଶି௡)ഀ
మ೅
ುೃ ൨

         (2) 

 
Proof. Refer to “Appendix 1”  
Based on the primary ݍ௠ , CLPH’s problem is 
solved. The problem is formulated in the 
following subsection. 

Tab. 2. Notations 
Decision variables 

௥ݏ  Retailer’s level of after-sales 
service (unit) 

p௥ Per unit retail price ($/unit) 
q୫ Level of product quality (unit) 
R୰ Order-up-to level (unit)  
Parameters  

D଴  Primary market size (unit/year) 

A୰ Unit ordering cost for the retailer 
($/order) 

h୰ Inventory holding cost per unit for 
the retailer ($/unit) 

h୫ Inventory holding cost per unit for the 
manufacturer ($/unit) 

L Lead time, given (year) 
y Demand in protection interval 

( ܶ	 + ܮ	 ), following a Normal 
distribution as ܰܦ)݈ܽ݉ݎ݋(T	 +
	L), 	T√ߪ + 	L) 

T Length of a review period (year) 
n Production multiplier for the 

manufacturer (݊ ∈ ܼା) 
w Wholesale price offered by the 

manufacturer to the retailer per unit 
($/unit) 

v Manufacturer’s setup cost per setup 
($/setup) 

c Manufacturer’s production cost per 
item ($/item) 

π Shortage cost per unit for the 
retailer ($/unit) 

α Demand sensitivity to quality level 
(unit) 

β Demand sensitivity to the level of 
after-sales service (unit) 

θ Demand sensitivity to retail price 
(unit) 

γ Cost efficiency coefficient of 
investment in product quality 
($/unit) 

σ Standard deviation of demand 
within protection interval 

δ Cost coefficient of after-sales 
service per unit service, per unit 
demand ($/unit service/unit 
demand)   

λ Cost coefficient of after-sales 
service independent of demand 
($/unit service) 

PR Manufacturer’s production rate per 
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year (unit/year) 
d Coordination parameter 

(discount/surcharge) 
d୫୧୬ The lower limit of the coordination 

parameter 
d୫ୟ୶ The upper limit of the coordination 

parameter 
dୱ୦ୟ୰୧୬୥ The exact value of the coordination 

parameter 
 
4-1-2. Retailer (CLPH) model 
Here, the CLPH’s problem is formulated, and the 
optimal values of its decisions on pricing, service 
level, and after-sales service are calculated. 
CLPH profit function is:  
 
௥(ܴ௥ߨ , ௥ݏ , (௥݌ = ௥݌) − ݓ − ଴ܦ)(௥ݏߜ + ௠ݍߙ +
௥ݏߚ − (௥݌ߠ −

஺ೝ
்
− ℎ௥ ቂܴ௥ − ଴ܦ) + ௠ݍߙ + ௥ݏߚ −

ܮ(௥݌ߠ −
(஽బାఈ௤೘ାఉ௦ೝିఏ௣ೝ)்

ଶ
ቃ − భ

మ
ఒ௦ೝమ

்
−

ଵ
்
ݕ)ܧߨ − ܴ௥)ା             (3) 

 
which expresses CLPH's revenue minus ordering 
cost, holding cost, service cost, and its shortage 
cost. The service cost is adopted from [38] and 
[39]. Moreover, as proposed by Vijayan and 
Kumaran, the holding cost in the periodic review 
inventory system is ℎ௥ ቂܴ௥ ܮܦ− − ஽்

ଶ
ቃ [40]. 

Accordingly, this study considers CLPH’s 
holding cost as ℎ௥ ቂܴ௥ − ଴ܦ) + ௠ݍߙ + ௥ݏߚ −

ܮ(௥݌ߠ −
(஽బାఈ௤೘ାఉ௦ೝିఏ௣ೝ)்

ଶ
ቃ . As explained 

before, we have assumed a Normal distribution 
ܶ)ܦ)ܰ) + ,(ܮ ܶ√ߪ +  for the demand within ((ܮ
the protection interval (ܶ +  Accordingly, the .(ܮ
order-up-to level, ܴ௥ , will be equal to ܦ(ܶ +
(ܮ + ݇௥ߪ√ܶ +  ,Moreover, according to [41] .	ܮ
the shortage quantity in each period is:  
 
ݕ)ܧ − ܴ௥)ା = ∫ ݕ) − ܴ௥)

ஶ
ோೝ ௬݂݀௬ =

ܶ√ߪ +  (4)             (௥݇)ܷ	ܮ
 
where ܷ(݇௥)  is equal to ௭݂(݇௥) − ݇௥[1 −
௭(݇௥)ܨ ௭(݇௥)]. ௭݂(݇௥) andܨ  are standard Normal 
probability and cumulative distribution functions, 
respectively. In these functions, subscript ݖ  is 
used instead of subscript y  to imply that the 
normal distribution of y  is changed into the 
standard form of the Normal distribution.  
Besides, due to the fact that order-up-to level ܴ௥  
is equal to ܦ(ܶ + (ܮ + ݇௥ߪ√ܶ + 	ܮ , for 
simplicity, safety factor ݇௥ can be considered as 

one of CLPH’s decisions instead of ܴ௥ . Such an 
assumption is made in [29]. Accordingly, the 
corresponding service level ( ܮܴܵ ) can be 
obtained as ܨ௭(݇௥), which is adopted from [29]. 
Based on this consideration, the profit function of 
retailer is converted to the following equation: 
 
,௥(݇௥ߨ ,௥ݏ (௥݌ = ௥݌) − ݓ − ଴ܦ)(௥ݏߜ + ௠ݍߙ +
௥ݏߚ − (௥݌ߠ −

஺ೝ
்
− భ

మ
ఒ௦ೝమ

்
−

ℎ௥ ቂ
(஽బାఈ௤೘ାఉ௦ೝିఏ௣ೝ)்

ଶ
+ ܶ√ߪ + ቃ	ܮ −

గఙ√்ା௅	
்

ܷ(݇௥)             (5) 
 
CLPH tries to optimize the values of price, safety 
factor, and after-sales service. To calculate these 
optimal values, the following proposition holds. 
Proposition 2. CLPH’s profit function is concave 
over ݇௥, s୰, and ݌௥. 
Proof. Refer to “Appendix 2”. 
s௥∗, p௥∗, and ݇௥

∗ are used to denote the optimum 
amounts of CLPH’s decisions under the 
decentralized model, which are calculated based 
on the first-order derivative of Equation (5) w.r.t. 
௥∗, and ݇௥݌ ,∗௥ݏ

∗ as follows: 
 

∗௥ݏ =
ଵ

ଶ	ఋఉ(ଵିெఈ)ାഊ೅ି
ಿభಿమ

మഇ(భషಾഀ)

ቈܦ଴ ቀ
ேభ

ଶఏ(ଵିெఈ)
−

ቁߜ + ቀݓ ேభ
ଶఏ(ଵିெఈ)

ߠ − ቁߚ + ߙܯ ቆߚݓ −

௪ఏேభ
ଶఏ(ଵିெఈ)

+ ℎ௥
்
ଶ
ቀߚ − ேభ

ଶఏ(ଵିெఈ)
ቁቇߠ −

ℎ௥
்
ଶ
ቀߚ − ேభ

ଶఏ(ଵିெఈ)
ቁߠ + ቀఈ

మ

ி
൬(ݓ − ܿ) −

்௛೘(௡ିଵ)
ଶ

൰ − ଴ቁܦߙܯ ቀ
ேభ

ଶఏ(ଵିெఈ)
−  ቁ቉          (6)ߜ

where ܯ =
௛೘ఈ(ଶି௡)

೅
ುೃ

ఊା௛௠൤(ଶି௡)ഀ
మ೅
ುೃ ൨

, ଵܰ = ߠܯߜߙ− +

ߜߠ + (1− ߚ(ߙܯ , ଶܰ = ߚ ߚߙܯ− +
1)ߠߜ − ܨ and ,(ߙܯ = ߛ + ℎ௠ ቂ(2 − ݊)ఈ

మ்
௉ோ
ቃ. 

∗௥݌ =
ଵ

ଶఏ(ଵିெఈ)ି ಿమಿభ
మ	ഃഁ(భషಾഀ)శഊ೅

൥ܦ଴ ቆ1−

ேమ
ଶ	ఋఉ(ଵିெఈ)ାഊ೅

ቇߜ + ߠቆݓ − ேమ
ଶ	ఋఉ(ଵିெఈ)ାഊ೅

ቇߚ +

ߙܯ ൭−ߠݓ + ௪ఉேమ
ଶ	ఋఉ(ଵିெఈ)ାഊ೅

− ℎ௥
்
ଶ
ቆߠ −

ߚ ேమ
ଶ	ఋఉ(ଵିெఈ)ାഊ೅

ቇ൱ +
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ℎ௥
்
ଶ
ቆߠ − ߚ ேమ

ଶ	ఋఉ(ଵିெఈ)ାഊ೅
ቇ + ቀఈ

మ

ி
൬(ݓ − ܿ) −

்௛೘(௡ିଵ)
ଶ

൰ − ଴ቁቆ1ܦߙܯ −
ேమ

ଶ	ఋఉ(ଵିெఈ)ାഊ೅
 (7)				ቇ൩ߜ

݇௥
∗ = ௭ܨ

ିଵ ൬1 − ቀ௛ೝ்
గ
ቁ൰            (8) 

 
According to Equation (8), the corresponding 
service level is ܴܵܮ∗ = ௭(݇௥ܨ

∗) = 1 − ቀ௛ೝ்
గ
ቁ.  

After determining the optimal decisions of 
retailer on pricing, after-sales service, and service 
level, MEC determines the optimal level of 
product quality as follows: 
 

∗௠ݍ =
ఈ൤(௪ି௖)ି௛೘ ቂ(ଶି௡) ೅ುೃ(ୈబାஒ௦ೝ

∗ି஘௣ೝ∗)ା
౐(౤షభ)

మ
ቃ൨

ఊା௛೘൤(ଶି௡)
ഀమ೅
ುೃ ൨

 

              (9) 
 
The above optimal decisions are derived in such a 
way that MEC’s and CLPH’s single profit is 
optimized, while the entire system optimality is 
not guaranteed. To calculate pricing and the three 
quality improvement decisions, the centralized 
model is formulated in next subsection. 
 
4-2. Centralized model 
Here, profit optimization of the entire SC is 
considered, and the best values of decision 
variables are simultaneously calculated. The 
profit function to be optimized in this structure is 
the sum of both members’ profit function: 

 
,௦௖(݇௥ߨ ௥ݏ , ,௥݌ (௠ݍ = ௥ߨ + ௠ߨ =
௥݌) − ܿ − ଴ܦ)(௥ݏߜ + ௠ݍߙ + ௥ݏߚ − (௥݌ߠ −

஺ೝ
்
− ℎ௥ ቂ

(஽బାఈ௤೘ାఉ௦ೝିఏ௣ೝ)்
ଶ

+ ݇௥ߪ√ܶ + ቃܮ − భ
మ
ఒ௦ೝమ

்
−

ଵ
்
ܶ√ߪߨ + (௥݇)ܷ	ܮ −

௩
௡்
− ଵ

ଶ
௠ଶݍߛ − ℎ௠ ቂ(஽బାఈ௤೘ାఉ௦ೝିఏ௣ೝ)்

ଶ
ቃ ቂ(஽బାఈ௤೘ାఉ௦ೝିఏ௣ೝ)

௉ோ
(2 − ݊)+ (݊ − 1)ቃ    (10) 

 
To ensure the concavity of this function, the following proposition is defined: 
Proposition 3. The SC’s profit function is concave over ݇௥, ௠ݍ ,  :௥ under the following conditions݌ ௥, andݏ
 
(ܶ/ߣ)) + ߚߜ2 + ߠଶ)(2ߚܪ (ଶߠܪ+ − ߚ) + ߠߜ + ଶ(ߚߠܪ > 0             (11) 
ቀ2δβ + ఒ

்
+ Hβଶቁ(ߙ + ଶ(ߠߙܪ + ߚ) + ߠߜ + ߛ)ଶ(ߚߠܪ + (ଶߙܪ + ߜߙ) ߠଶ(2(ߚߙܪ+ + Hߠଶ) ≤

ቀ2δβ + ఒ
்
+ Hβଶቁ(2ߠ + Hߠଶ)(ߛ + (ଶߙܪ + ൫2(ߜߙ + ߙ)(ߚߙܪ + ߚ)(ߠߙܪ + ߠߜ +  ൯           (12)(ߚߠܪ

 
where ܪ = ℎ௠ܶ

(ଶି௡)
௉ோ

. 

Proof. see “Appendix 3”. 
By simultaneously solving the following equations, the optimal values of  ݇௥, ௠ݍ , ௥ݏ , and ݌௥  under the 
centralized model are calculated. 
డగೞ೎
డ௞

= 0 → −ℎ௥ߪ√ܶ + 	ܮ − ଵ
்
ܶ√ߪߨ + ௭(݇௥)ܨ)	ܮ − 1) = 0               (13) 

డగೞ೎
డ௣ೝ	

= 0 → ଴ܦ) + ௠ݍߙ + ௥ݏߚ − (௥݌ߠ2 − ܿ)ߠ	 + (௥ݏߜ +
௛ೝ
ଶ
ܶߠ	 + ℎ௠ܶߠ ቀ

(஽బାఈ௤೘ାఉ௦ೝିఏ௣ೝ)(ଶି௡)
௉ோ

+ ௡ିଵ
ଶ
ቁ =

0                         (14) 
డగೞ೎
డ௦ೝ

= 0 → ଴ܦ)ߜ− + ௠ݍߙ + ௥ݏߚ − (௥݌ߠ + ௥݌)ߚ − ܿ − (௥ݏߜ −
ఒ௦ೝ
்
− ௛ೝ

ଶ
ܶߚ	 − ℎ௠ܶߚ ൬(ܦ଴ + ௠ݍߙ + ௥ݏߚ −

(௥݌ߠ
(ଶି௡)
௉ோ

+ ௡ିଵ
ଶ
൰ = 0                   (15) 

డగೞ೎
డ௤೘

= 0 → ௥݌) − ܿ − ߙ(௥ݏߜ −	
௛ೝఈ்
ଶ

− ௠ݍߛ − ℎ௠ܶߙ ቂ(2 − ݊) (஽బାఈ௤೘ାఉ௦ೝିఏ௣ೝ)
௉ோ

+ (௡ିଵ)
ଶ
ቃ = 0          (16) 

 
Suppose that ܪᇱ = ቀ2ߚߜ + ఒ

்
+ ቁܪଶߚ − ଵ

ி
ߜߙ) + ଶ(ߚߙܪ ᇱᇱܪ , = ߠ2) + (ܪଶߠ − ଵ

ி
ߙ) + ଶ(ܪߠߙ ᇱᇱᇱܪ , =

ߙ) + ଵି(ܪߠߙ
ி
ߙߜ) + (ߚܪߙ + ߚ + ߜߠ + ܪߚߠ , ܱᇱ = ߙܥ− − ℎ௠ ቂ(2 − ݊)ఈ்

௉ோ
଴ܦ +

ఈ்(௡ିଵ)
ଶ

ቃ ଵܤ , =
ߙ) + (ܪߠߙ ଵ

ி
൫(−ߜ)ߙ − ൯ߚܪߙ + ߚ + ߜߠ + ܼ and ,ܪߚߠ = ߜ)− + (ܪߚ ఈ

ி
ߙ) (ߠߙܪ+ + ߠߜ + ߚ + ߚܪߠ , the 

optimal values of decision variables are:  
݇௥

∗∗ = ௭ܨ
ିଵ(1 − ୘୦౨

஠
) → ∗∗ܮܴܵ = ௭(݇௥ܨ

∗∗) = 1 − ቀ௛௥்
గ
ቁ                (17) 
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∗∗௥݌ =
஻భቆି(ఋାுఉ)

ഀ
ಷ
ቀି೓ೝഀ೅మ ାைቁିఋ஽బିఉ௖ି

೓ೝ
మ 	ఉ்ି௛೘ఉ்ቀ஽బ

(మష೙)
ುೃ ା೙షభమ ቁቇ

൬(ଶఏାఏమு)ିభಷ(ఈାுఈఏ)
మ൰ୌᇲା஻భ((ఋାఉு)

ഀ
ಷ
(ఈାுఈఏ)ି	ఋఏିఉିఉఏு)

+

஽బାఏ௖ା
೓ೝ
మ 	ఏ்ା௛೘ఏ்ቀ

ವబ(మష೙)
ುೃ ା೙షభమ ቁା(ఈାఈఏு)భಷቀି

೓ೝഀ೅
మ ାைቁ

(ଶఏାఏమு)ିభಷ(ఈାுఈఏ)
మା஻భ

(ഃశഁಹ)ഀಷ(ഀశಹഀഇ)ష	ഃഇషഁషഁഇಹ

ౄᇲ

              (18) 

∗∗௥ݏ =
஽బାఏቀ௖ା

೓ೝ
మ ்ቁାቀுఏ஽బା௛೘ఏ்

೙షభ
మ
ቁ(ఈାఈఏு)భಷቀை

ᇲା೓ೝഀ೅మ
ቁ

ுᇲᇲுᇲିுᇲᇲᇲ௓
−

(ఋାఉு)ഀಷ(ை
ᇲା೓ೝഀ೅మ )ାఋ஽బା௖ఉା

೓ೝ
మ 	ఉ்ାఉ்ቀ஽బ

(మష೙)
ುೃ ା೙షభమ ቁ

ୌᇲିಹ
ᇲᇲᇲೋ
ಹᇲᇲ

 

                     (19) 

∗∗௠ݍ =
ቀఈା୦ౣ(ଶି௡)
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∗∗

ఊା୦ౣ൤(ଶି௡)
ഀమ೅
ುೃ ൨

−
௖஑ାቀஔ஑ା୦ౣ(ଶି௡)

ഀ೅
ುೃஒቁୱ

∗∗ି	౞౨ಉ౐మ ି୦ౣቂ(ଶି௡)
ഀ೅
ುೃୈబା

ಉ౐(౤షభ)
మ

ቃ

ఊା୦ౣ൤(ଶି௡)
ഀమ೅
ುೃ ൨

            (20)

 
The centralized decision-making model on 
product quality, pricing, and service decisions 
optimizes the whole SC profit; however, it does 
not necessarily mean that both MEC and CLPH 
meet their own optimum benefits. This structure 
may even cause losses for one of them. 
Accordingly, it may refuse to choose centralized 
decisions and tend to choose decisions of the 
decentralized structure. Hence, for motivating all 
members to accept the centralized model, a 
bilateral wholesale price (BWP) coordination 
contract is developed in the following. 
 
4-3. Coordinated model: BWP contract 
As explained in the previous section, the 
centralized model may cause losses for some SC 
members, while it is optimal for the whole SC. 
Accordingly, to encourage all SC members in 
integrated decision- making, an incentive 
mechanism is required [42]. For this purpose, in 
this section, a bilateral wholesale price (BWP) 
coordination contract is suggested. According to 
this contract, MEC offers a wholesale price equal 
to dw, instead of	w. According to the scenarios 
that may occur under the centralized model, 
parameter d can be between zero and one  

 
(0 ≤ ݀ ≤ 1 ) or be greater than one ( ݀ ≥ 1 ); 
Scenario I: under the centralized model, MEC 
incurs losses and CLPH gains profit in 
comparison to the decentralized structure. 
Scenario II: CLPH incurs losses and MEC gains 
profit in the centralized structure in comparison 
to the decentralized one. For achieving 
coordination through BWP contract, in scenario I, 
the wholesale price should be increased, and in 
scenario II, it should be reduced. In fact, 
parameter d  makes the coordination contract a 
flexible and bilateral contract that considers both 
scenarios. It is notable that another scenario will 
be developed in which both SC members gain 
profits in the centralized structure in comparison 
to the decentralized one. In this situation, just the 
extra profits of the integrated decision-making 
are divided between the two members. The 
proposed BWP coordination model will be 
acceptable to both members if and only if it leads 
to at least their decentralized profits. 
Accordingly, the conditions of CLPH and MEC 
to participate in the coordinated model are 
derived. 
 

 
4-3-1. Retailer (CLPH) condition 
CLPH’s condition to accept BWP contract is represented by the following equation: 
ܶ ௥ܲ

௖௢(݇௥
∗∗, ܶ∗∗, ,∗∗௥݌ ,∗∗௥ݏ (ݓ݀ ≥ ܶ ௥ܲ

ௗ௖(ܶ∗, ݇௥
∗, ,∗௥݌    ௥∗)     (21)ݏ

Based on the above inequality, the upper bound of the coordination parameter is calculated:  

݀௠௔௫ =

(௣ೝ∗∗ିஔ௦ೝ∗∗)ேయା
ఽ౨
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ಿర౐
మ
ቃିቂಿయ౐మ ቃቁ

ି(௣ೝ∗ି୵ିஔ௦ೝ∗)ேరି
ఽ౨
౐ ି

ಓ
మቆ

ೞೝ∗∗
మ

౐ ିೞೝ
∗మ

౐
ቇିഏಚ೅ ൫√୘ା୐	௎(௞ೝ

∗∗)ି√୘ା୐	௎(௞ೝ∗)൯

୵ேయ
               (22)

 
where ଷܰ = ଴ܦ) + ∗∗௠ݍߙ + ∗∗௥ݏߚ − (∗∗௥݌ߠ  and 
ସܰ = ଴ܦ) + ∗௠ݍߙ + ∗௥ݏߚ −  .(∗௥݌ߠ

If ݀ > ݀௠௔௫ , CLPH may not accept the 
coordination scheme, since it cannot achieve its  

 
minimum profit. Similarly, MEC’s condition for 
taking part in BWP scheme can be derived. 
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4-3-2. Manufacturer (MEC) condition 
MEC’s condition to accept the coordination 
contract is: 
ܶ ௠ܲ

௖௢(ݍ௠∗∗, (ݓ݀ ≥ ܶ ௥ܲ
ௗ௖(ݍ௠∗)         (23) 

 
Based on the above inequality, the lower bound 
of the coordination parameter is calculated:  
 
݀௠௜௡ =
(௪ି௖)ேరା௖ேయା

భ
మఊ௤೘

∗∗మା௛೘ቂ
ಿయ೅
మ
ቃቂಿయ
ುೃ
(ଶି௡)ା(௡ିଵ)ቃ

௪ேయ
−

భ
మఊ௤೘

∗మା௛೘ቂ
ಿర೅
మ
ቃቂಿర
ುೃ
(ଶି௡)ା(௡ିଵ)ቃ

௪ேయ
         (24) 

 
For any value of ݀  belonging to interval 
[݀௠௜௡ , ݀௠௔௫] , coordination will be achieved. 
Since the SC members are of different market 
powers, it is anticipated that the dominant 
member achieves more profits than the other 
member. In the next section, a profit-sharing 
policy is applied, which takes the SC members' 
bargaining power into account. Accordingly, the 
exact value of parameter ݀ can be calculated. 
 
4-3-3. Profit-sharing strategy 
Here, to specify each member's surplus profit 
under the BWP contract, the exact value of ݀ is 
calculated based on their bargaining powers. 
Parameter ߰	 denotes the CLPH’s bargaining 
power. Accordingly, 1-߰   is related to MEC’s. 
Thus, the profits of members in the coordinated 
model are calculated as follows: 
 
ܶ ௥ܲ

௖௢(݇௥
∗∗, ∗∗௥݌ , ,∗∗௥ݏ (ݓ݀ =

ܶ ௥ܲ
ௗ௖(݇௥

∗, ,∗௥݌ (∗௥ݏ +  (25)          ݒ݁݀߰
ܶ ௠ܲ

௖௢(ݍ௠∗∗, (ݓ݀ = ܶ ௥ܲ
ௗ௖(ݍ௠∗) + (1 −  ݒ݁݀(߰

            (26) 
 
where 
ݒ݁݀ =
ܶ ௦ܲ௖

௖௡௧(݇௥
∗∗, ,∗∗௥݌ ,∗∗௥ݏ ܶ−(∗∗௠ݍ ௦ܲ௖

ௗ௖(݇௥
∗, ,∗௥݌ ,∗௥ݏ  (∗௠ݍ

 
By solving the first equation, the exact value of 
݀, namely ݀௦௛௔௥௜௡௚ , is obtained as follows:  
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by selecting the coordination parameter as equal 
to ݀௦௛௔௥௜௡௚ , the surplus profit is shared among 

CLPH and MEC according to their bargaining 
powers. 
 

5. Numerical Experiment and 
Sensitivity Analysis 

In order to better examine the model 
applicability, it is run based on the data of the 
investigated cell phone supply chain (SC) case. 
The data used to run the model are represented in 
Table 3. Some parameters are estimated based on 
the experts’ opinions; for instance, the parameters 
representing demand sensitivity to quality, price, 
and service are estimated as ߙ = ߠ ,14 = 35, and 
ߚ = 12 , respectively. The unit for costs and 
prices is $/unit. 
The current decisions and the model results on 
profits under the case data are shown in Table 4. 
As shown in this table, the centralized structure 
results in a higher level of product quality, a 
lower product price, and higher level of services 
in comparison to the decentralized structure. The 
SC’s profit in the centralized model is 
$21827.084, which has improved by about 
10.45% in comparison with the decentralized 
model. The manufacturer’s (MEC’s) profit under 
this model has improved, whereas the retailer’s 
(CLPH’s) profit has decreased in comparison to 
the decentralized structure. This is because of 
higher services and lower prices that CLPH must 
offer under the centralized model. Thus, CLPH 
may prefer traditional decision-making rather 
than the centralized one. Accordingly, the cell 
phone SC will not reach its optimal profit, and 
the 10.45% increase in its profitability will be 
lost. The same occurs for MEC’s profit. Thus, to 
maintain the profit improvement, MEC decides to 
offer a reduced wholesale price to CLPH as a 
coordination contract. This strategy leads to 
profit improvements for both MEC and CLPH 
compared to the decentralized model. The 
improvements are 14.22% and 6.45% for CLPH 
and MEC, respectively. Moreover, the cell phone 
SC reaches its centralized profit. Overall, by 
applying the proposed bilateral wholesale price 
(BWP) contract, MEC and CLPH can enhance 
their quality improvement strategies (i.e., product 
quality improvement and level of services), while 
their profits increase. Therefore, the proposed 
contract is both economically and socially 
profitable. 
In the following, a set of sensitivity analysis tests 
is carried out by considering some pivotal 
parameters so as to examine the proposed model 
under different channel structures. 
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In Fig. 1(a), the changes in the level of quality 
investment with respect to the changes in demand 
sensitivity to quality are examined. As this 
parameter grows, i.e., the customers become more 
sensitive to the product quality, MEC invests 
more in the product quality level. The investment 
under BWP contract is much more than the 
investment under the decentralized structure. 
Accordingly, one obvious conclusion will be the 
fact that MEC’s profit under BWP contract is 
lower than that in the decentralized structure. 
However, according to Fig. 1(b), the coordination 
model (BWP contract) leads to more profits for 
MEC in comparison to the decentralized model. 
This implies the great advantage of the proposed 
coordination model in encouraging MEC to 
increase the quality of products while making 
more profits. Figs. 2. (a), (b) show the changes in 
product price and after-sales service with respect 
to an increase in demand sensitivity to quality, 
respectively. The figures demonstrate that 
whenever demand sensitivity to quality 
investment grows, the product price and after-
sales service take more values under both 
decentralized and coordination models. However, 
as is demonstrated in Fig. 2. (a), the product price 
under BWP contract is much less than its value 
under the decentralized model. Moreover, from 
Fig. 2. (b), it can be seen that CLPH invests more 
in after-sales service under BWP contract 
compared to individual decision-making. Thus, 
under the proposed BWP contract, CLPH sells the 
cell phone with a lower price and higher level of 
after-sales service compared to the decentralized 
model. Accordingly, one can expect that CLPH 
makes less profit under the BWP contract in 
comparison to the decentralized structure. 
However, the great point is that the BWP 
coordination contract leads to more profits for 
CLPH compared to individual decision-making 
regardless of the higher services and lower prices 
offered by CLPH under the contract. The above 
results show that the BWP contract is also 
beneficial for the customers since they can buy 
products with higher levels of services and lower 
prices. Fig. 3. shows the changes in after-sales 
services under different amounts of demand 
sensitivity to services. It shows a growing 
divergence between the level of after-sales 
services in the decentralized model and that in the 
coordinated model with respect to increasing 
service elasticity coefficient of demand. In other 
words, with an increase in demand sensitivity to 
services, the BWP coordination model creates a 
faster growth in after-sales services rather than the 

decentralized one. In Fig.4. (a), the changes in 
CLPH’s profit with respect to demand sensitivity 
to services are examined, and the positive 
relationship between them is shown. From the 
figure, it is concluded that whenever demand 
sensitivity to services heightens and the market 
becomes more sensitive to services, the BWP 
coordination model facilitates investing to a 
greater degree in the services, leading to more 
profits for CLPH compared to the decentralized 
one. This is due to MEC’s offer of lower 
wholesale prices for CLPH. Although the profit of 
MEC under the BWP contract is lower than its 
profit under the centralized structure, it is still 
more than that of the individual decision-making 
structure (Fig. 4. (b)). Generally, under the 
situations where demand sensitivity to services 
grows, the application of the BWP coordination 
model is profitable for the whole SC, as well (Fig. 
4. (b)). Fig. 5. (a) shows that whenever shortage 
cost increases, as expected, CLPH tries to hold 
more values of safety stock to maintain its service 
level in the market. This is the same under the 
coordination model with a difference that CLPH 
makes more profits under the coordination model 
in comparison to individual decision-making one, 
while it holds the same amount of safety stock as 
the decentralized model. Thus, under BWP 
contract, CLPH can maintain its service level 
while its profit undergoes little decrease. In Fig. 5. 
(b), it is observed that the graph of CLPH profit in 
the coordination structure is above all other 
graphs. Moreover, under the conditions with high 
shortage costs, the proposed contract results in 
less profit loss for the whole cell phone SC rather 
than the decentralized model (Fig. 5. (c)). Fig. 6. 
(a) shows the effect of changes in holding cost on 
CLPH profit. As can be seen, according to this 
change, CLPH profit decreases under all 
structures. However, the amount of decrease 
under the coordination structure is less than the 
others, which shows the model’s economic 
benefits. From Fig. 6. (b), as expected, by 
increasing retailer’s holding cost, CLPH decreases 
the amount of safety stock to hold. This act may 
increase its shortage costs and, thus, reduce its 
service level and profits. However, as Fig. 6. (a) 
clearly shows, this reduction under the 
coordinated structure is much less than the other 
structures. This implies the model applicability 
under different economic conditions of the 
market, and shows that the model can be used as 
an efficient management strategy for reducing the 
risks of shortages. 
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Tab. 3. Case data 
Parameter Value Parameter Value Parameter Value Parameter Value 

 1000 ߪ 44 ݓ 60 ߛ ଴ 3000ܦ

 1.9 ߨ 30 ܿ 54 ߣ 14 ߙ

 2 ܮ 100 ݒ ௥ 350ܣ 12 ߚ

  ℎ௥ 5 ܴܲ 1000 ܶ 33 35 ߠ

 ℎ௠ 1 ݊ 2 ߰ 0.7 0.1 ߜ

 
Tab. 4. Results of implementing the model based on case data 

Structure ݍ௠ ݌௥ ݏ௥  ݇௥ ܴ௥ ܴܵߨ ܮ௥
௠ߨ  ௦௖ߨ   

Decentralized 3.256 65.688 0.305 0.712 30475.54 0.76 10164.716 9596.861 19761.577 

Centralized 6.797 59.444 0.414 0.712 39897.54 0.76 9537.957 12289.127 21827.084 

Coordination 6.797 59.444 0.414 0.712 39897.54 0.76 11610.571 10216.513 21827.084 

 

 
Fig. 1. the effect of changes in demand sensitivity to quality on: (a) the level of quality investment and 

(b) MEC profit under different structures 
 

6. Conclusion 
Supply chain (SC) coordination is an innovative 
policy searching for a strategy to eliminate the 
deficiencies of the decentralized structure [43]. In 
this study, a coordination model was proposed 
across a manufacturer-retailer SC of a real cell 
phone case. Due to the competitive market of cell 
phones, the company seeks optimal quality-
improvement strategies at different levels of its 
SC. It invests in quality improvement in the 
production level and sales level. Accordingly, to 
investigate these strategies, the SC demand 
function is considered to be dependent on the 
product quality, after-sales service, and price. In 
the investigated case, the manufacturer (MEC) 
decides on the investment in product quality 
level. The retailer (CLPH) decides on after-sales 

service and the price. Moreover, it decides on 
safety stock level under a periodic review 
inventory model in order to enhance its service 
level in the market. Since MEC and CLPH’s 
decisions are interrelated, their profitability is 
influenced by each other’s decisions. In the 
current situation, MEC and CLPH make 
individual decisions to improve their own profit 
regardless of the other’s profits. This does not 
lead to the optimal quality improvement strategy 
for the SC. Accordingly, this study considered 
the centralized model in which a central decision-
maker determines the pricing, quality, after-sales 
service, and safety stock decisions to optimize the 
whole SC performance. However, based on the 
scenarios which may occur under the centralized 
model, these centralized decisions may not be 
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acceptable to MEC or CLPH. Thus, a bilateral 
wholesale price (BWP) contract is proposed to 
coordinate the SC and motivate MEC and CLPH 
to choose the centralized decisions. The results of 
the model showed that the BWP contract could 

effectively coordinate the cell phone SC members 
and enhance their profits compared to the case, 
where they make individual decisions. Moreover, 
the comprehensive sensitivity analyses led to the 
following managerial implications. 

 

 
Fig. 2. The effect of quality elasticity coefficient of demand on: (a) product price, (b) after-sales 

service, and (c) retailer profit. 
 

 
Fig. 3. Changes of after-sales services w.r.t. demand sensitivity to service 
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Fig. 4. The effect of changes in demand sensitivity to services on (a) retailer profit, (b) manufacturer 

profit, and (c) SC profit  
 

 The coordinated model provides the 
possibility that none of the members not 
only bears cost, but also makes more profits 
in comparison to the decentralized model. 
The model provides the SC members with 
flexibility to increase after-sales services, 
reduce the product price, and increase the 
product quality while they make more 
profits compared to the other decision-
making models. As explained in the 
literature, pricing policies can effectively 
influence the firm’s losses [44]. Applying 
the BWP contract could adjust decisions on 
pricing, as well as other decisions, in such a 
way that the firms incur less losses. 

 Under the proposed BWP coordination 
contract, CLPH can provide a higher service 
level in the market even under high levels of 
shortage costs. This is because of the fact 
that, under the BWP contract, if CLPH is 
incurred by losses, it can buy products with a 
lower wholesale price from MEC. This may 
compensate it for high costs of holding more 

safety stocks. Thus, the model is highly 
applicable in reducing the risks of shortages. 

 When customers are highly sensitive to the 
product quality, the investment in product 
quality goes up. Under the BWP contract, 
this investment is higher than the 
decentralized one. However, the profit for 
MEC in the coordination model is still more 
than the decentralized structure. Thus, the 
BWP contract enables MEC to enhance its 
strategy on SC quality improvement in the 
production level. 

 Whenever demand sensitivity to quality 
investment takes more values, the product 
price and after-sales service increase, since 
they are dependent on the product quality. 
However, the product price in the 
coordinated model is very lower than that in 
the decentralized one. Moreover, CLPH 
invests more in after-sales service under the 
coordinated structure rather than the 
decentralized structure. However, despite the 
expectations, the BWP coordination contract 
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provides a more profitable situation for 
CLPH rather than the decentralized structure. 
Accordingly, the BWP contract creates a 
good advantage for the customers, as well. In 
fact, the BWP model improves their buying 
power through enabling the retailer in price 
reduction; moreover, they will receive greater 
after-sales services. Hence, the coordination 
model with BWP contract provides a more 
profitable condition for all SC members and 
the customers. 

 Since, in one scenario, under the BWP 
contract, the manufacturer proposes a lower 
wholesale price to the retailer in a highly 
sensitive market to the services, investing 
more in the services leads to more profits for 
the retailer compared to the decentralized 
one. Even though the manufacturer’s profit 
under the coordination structure is lower than 
that under the centralized one, it still makes 
more profits than the profit made in the 
decentralized structure. The same occurs 
under the other scenario, where the market is 
more sensitive to quality and the retailer pays 

a more amount of wholesale price to the 
manufacturer to enable him to invest more in 
product quality. 

 The BWP contract is flexible and can 
coordinate the investigated SC under 
different scenarios that happen under the 
centralized structure. Moreover, the surplus 
profit can be divided between MEC and 
CLPH considering their bargaining powers in 
the market, making the contract be more 
similar to real-world situations. For further 
research, one extension can be considering a 
three-echelon SC including suppliers, 
manufacturers, and retailers, since the effect 
of raw materials provided by the suppliers on 
the product quality cannot be ignored. This 
paper did not model competitive situations, 
since the aim of the paper was to enhance 
strategies for quality improvement in 
production and sales level by considering the 
related decisions. One interesting topic for 
the future can be considering multiple 
retailers and different game structures to 
model the competition among them.

 

 
Fig. 5. The effect of shortage cost on: (a) safety stock, (b) retailer profit, and (c) SC profit 
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Fig. 6. The effect of retailer’s inventory holding cost on (a) retailer profit and (b) safety stock 

 
Appendix 
Appendix 1. Analyzing the concavity of manufacturer’s (MEC’s) profit function 
For proving concavity of the manufacturer’s profit function over ݍ௠ , the second-order derivative of  ߨ௠	must be 
calculated, and is shown that it is negative. The following equation, which is always negative, completes the proof. 
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Appendix 2. Analyzing the concavity of retailer’s (CLPH’s) profit function 
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The first, second, and third principle minors are calculated as follows:  
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As can be seen, ܪଵ is always negative, ܪଶ is always positive, and ܪଷ is negative under the condition represented in 
Equation (9). Thus, under this condition, the above Hessian matrix is negative definite; thus, the concavity is proved. 
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The third principle minor is negative if the following condition is satisfied. 
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According to the above calculations, the entire SC profit function is concave over all decision variables under the 
following conditions: 
 
൬ቀ2ߚߜ + ఒ

்
ଶቁߚܪ+ ߙ) + ଶ൰(ߠߙܪ + ൫(ߚ + ߠߜ + ߛ)ଶ(ߚߠܪ ଶ)൯ߙܪ+ + ߜߙ)) + ߠଶ(2(ߚߙܪ + ((ଶߠܪ ≤ ൬ቀ2ߚߜ + ఒ

்
+

ଶቁߚܪ ߠ2) ߛ)(ଶߠܪ+ ଶ)൰ߙܪ+ + ൫2(ߜߙ + ߙ)(ߚߙܪ ߚ)(ߠߙܪ+ + ߠߜ +  ൯               (16)(ߚߠܪ



308 Seyyed-Mahdi Hosseini-Motlagh, Mina Nouri-
Harzvili  & Roza Zirakpourdehkordi 

Two-Level Supply Chain Quality Improvement 
Through a Wholesale Price Coordination Contract on 
Pricing, Quality, and Services 

 

International Journal of Industrial Engineering & Production Research, September 2019, Vol. 30, No. 3                          

References 
[1] Li, S., Zhao, X., and Huo, B.. Supply 

chain coordination and innovativeness: A 
social contagion and learning 
perspective. International Journal of 
Production Economics, Vol. 205, (2018a), 
pp. 47-61. 

 
[2] Chaharsooghi, S. K., Heydari, J., & 

Kamalabadi, I. N. Simultaneous 
coordination of order quantity and reorder 
point in a two-stage supply chain. 
Computers & Operations Research, Vol. 
38, No. 12, (2011), pp. 1667-1677. 

 
[3] Johari, M., Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., & 

Nematollahi, M. Simultaneous 
coordination of review period and order-
up-to-level in a manufacturer-retailer 
chain. Journal of Industrial and Systems 
Engineering, Vol. 10, (2017a), pp. 1-17. 

 
[4] Nouri, M., Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., & 

Nematollahi, M. Proposing a discount 
policy for two-level supply chain 
coordination with periodic review 
replenishment and promotional efforts 
decisions. Operational Research, (2018a), 
pp. 1-34. 

 
[5] Johari, M., Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., 

Nematollahi, M., Goh, M., & Ignatius, J. 
Bi-level credit period coordination for 
periodic review inventory system with 
price-credit dependent demand under time 
value of money. Transportation Research 
Part E: Logistics and Transportation 
Review, Vol. 114, (2018), pp. 270-291. 

 
[6] Jazinaninejad, M., Seyedhosseini, S. M., 

Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., & Nematollahi, 
M. Coordinated decision-making on 
manufacturers EPQ-based and buyer’s 
period review inventory policies with 
stochastic price-sensitive demand: A credit 
option approach. RAIRO -Operations 
Research (2017). 

 
[7] Nematollahi, M., Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., 

& Heydari, J. Coordination of social 
responsibility and order quantity in a two-
echelon supply chain: A collaborative 

decision-making perspective. International 
Journal of Production Economics, Vol. 
184, (2017a), pp. 107-121. 

 
[8] Nematollahi, M., Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., 

Ignatius, J., Goh, M., & Nia, M. S. 
Coordinating a socially responsible 
pharmaceutical supply chain under 
periodic review replenishment policies. 
Journal of Cleaner Production, Vol. 172, 
(2018), pp. 2876-2891. 

 
[9] Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., Nematollahi, M., 

Johari, M., & Sarker, B. R. A collaborative 
model for coordination of monopolistic 
manufacturer's promotional efforts and 
competing duopolistic retailers' trade 
credits. International Journal of 
Production Economics, Vol. 204, (2018a), 
pp. 108-122. 

 
[10] Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., Nouri, M., & 

Pazari, P. Coordination of promotional 
effort, corporate social responsibility and 
periodic review replenishment decisions in 
a two-echelon socially responsible supply 
chain. Journal of Industrial and Systems 
Engineering, Vol. 11, No. 3, (2018b), pp. 
60-83. 

 
[11] Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., & Ebrahimi, S. 

Coordination of a green supply chain with 
one manufacturer and two duopolistic 
retailers through an environmental and 
social cost-sharing contract. Journal of 
Industrial and Systems Engineering, Vol. 
11, No. 3, (2018). 

 
[12] Johari, M., & Hosseini-Motlagh, S. 

Coordination of cooperative promotion 
efforts with competing retailers in a 
manufacturer-retailer supply chain. 
Uncertain Supply Chain Management, 
Vol. 6, No. 1, (2018), pp. 25-48. 

 
[13] Jerath, K., Kim, S. H., and Swinney, R. 

Product quality in a distribution channel 
with inventory risk. Marketing 
Science, Vol. 36, No. 5, (2017), pp. 747-
761. 

 



309 Seyyed-Mahdi Hosseini-Motlagh, Mina 
Nouri-Harzvili  & Roza Zirakpourdehkordi 

Two-Level Supply Chain Quality Improvement  
Through a Wholesale Price Coordination Contract  
on Pricing, Quality, and Services 
 

International Journal of Industrial Engineering & Production Research, September 2019, Vol. 30, No. 3                          

[14] Ma, P., Wang, H., and Shang, J. Contract 
design for two-stage supply chain 
coordination: Integrating manufacturer-
quality and retailer-marketing 
efforts. International Journal of 
Production Economics, Vol. 146, No. 2, 
(2013), pp. 745-755. 

 
[15] Seifbarghy, M., Nouhi, K., and 

Mahmoudi, A. Contract design in a supply 
chain considering price and quality 
dependent demand with customer 
segmentation. International Journal of 
Production Economics, Vol. 167, (2015), 
pp. 108-118. 

 
[16] Yoo, S. H., and Cheong, T. Quality 

improvement incentive strategies in a 
supply chain. Transportation Research 
Part E: Logistics and Transportation 
Review, Vol. 114, (2018), pp. 331-342. 

 
[17] Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., Nematollahi, M., 

& Nouri, M. Coordination of green quality 
and green warranty decisions in a two-
echelon competitive supply chain with 
substitutable products. Journal of Cleaner 
Production. Vol. 196, (2018), pp. 961-984. 

 
[18] Zhang, J., Cao, Q., & He, X. Contract and 

product quality in platform 
selling. European Journal of Operational 
Research, Vol. 272, No. 3, (2019), pp. 
928-944. 

 
[19] Sarkar, B., Guchhait, R., Sarkar, M., 

Pareek, S., and Kim, N. Impact of safety 
factors and setup time reduction in a two-
echelon supply chain 
management. Robotics and Computer-
Integrated Manufacturing, Vol. 55, 
(2019), pp. 250-258. 

 
[20] Li, G., Huang, F. F., Cheng, T. C. E., 

Zheng, Q., and Ji, P. Make-or-buy service 
capacity decision in a supply chain 
providing after-sales service. European 
Journal of Operational Research, Vol. 
239, No. 2, (2014), pp. 377-388. 

 
[21] Chen, M., Hu, Q., and Wei, H. Interaction 

of after-sales service provider and contract 

type in a supply chain. International 
Journal of Production Economics, Vol. 
193, (2017), pp. 514-527. 

 
[22] Wei, J., Zhao, J., and Li, Y. Price and 

warranty period decisions for 
complementary products with horizontal 
firms' cooperation/noncooperation 
strategies. Journal of Cleaner 
Production, Vol. 105, (2015), pp. 86-102. 

 
[23] Rezapour, S., Allen, J. K., and Mistree, F. 

Reliable flow in forward and after-sales 
supply chains considering propagated 
uncertainty. Transportation Research Part 
E: Logistics and Transportation 
Review, Vol. 93, (2016), pp. 409-436. 

 
[24] Kumar, K., and Aouam, T. Effect of setup 

time reduction on supply chain safety 
stocks. Journal of manufacturing 
systems, Vol. 49, (2018), pp. 1-15. 

 
[25] Heydari, J. Lead time variation control 

using reliable shipment equipment: An 
incentive scheme for supply chain 
coordination. Transportation research part 
E: Logistics and transportation 
Review, Vol. 63, (2014), pp. 44-58. 

 
[26] Liu, W., Wang, M., Zhu, D., and Zhou, L. 

Service capacity procurement of logistics 
service supply chain with demand 
updating and loss-averse 
preference. Applied Mathematical 
Modelling, Vol. 66, (2019), pp. 486-507. 

 
[27] Korponai, J., Tóth, Á. B., and Illés, B. 

Effect of the Safety Stock on the 
Probability of Occurrence of the Stock 
Shortage. Procedia Engineering, Vol. 182, 
(2017), pp. 335-341.    

 
[28] Ebrahimi, S., Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., 

and Nematollahi, M. Proposing a delay in 
payment contract for coordinating a two-
echelon periodic review supply chain with 
stochastic promotional effort dependent 
demand. International Journal of Machine 
Learning and Cybernetics, (2017), pp. 1-
14. 

 



310 Seyyed-Mahdi Hosseini-Motlagh, Mina Nouri-
Harzvili  & Roza Zirakpourdehkordi 

Two-Level Supply Chain Quality Improvement 
Through a Wholesale Price Coordination Contract on 
Pricing, Quality, and Services 

 

International Journal of Industrial Engineering & Production Research, September 2019, Vol. 30, No. 3                          

[29] Nematollahi, M., Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., 
and Heydari, J. Economic and social 
collaborative decision-making on visit 
interval and service level in a two-echelon 
pharmaceutical supply chain. Journal of 
cleaner production, Vol. 142, (2017b), pp. 
3956-3969. 

 
[30] Johari, M., Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., & 

Nematollahi, M. R. Coordinating pricing 
and periodic review replenishment 
decisions in a two-echelon supply chain 
using quantity discount contract. Journal 
of Industrial Engineering and Management 
Studies, Vol. 3, No. 2, (2017b), pp. 58-87. 

 
[31] Johari, M., Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., & 

Nematollahi, M. Supply Chain 
Coordination using Different Modes of 
Transportation Considering Stochastic 
Price-Dependent Demand and Periodic 
Review Replenishment Policy. 
International Journal of Transportation 
Engineering, Vol. 5, No. 2, (2017c), pp. 
137-165. 

 
[32] Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., Ebrahimi, S., & 

Nouri, M. Coordination of competitive 
advertising via investing in transportation 
lead time reduction. International Journal 
of Transportation Engineering (2018d). 

 
[33] Mai, D. T., Liu, T., Morris, M. D., & Sun, 

S. Quality coordination with extended 
warranty for store-brand 
products. European Journal of 
Operational Research, Vol. 256, No. 2, 
(2017), pp. 524-532. 

 
[34] Nematollahi, M., Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., 

& Heydari, J. A mathematical model for 
coordinating corporate social 
responsibility and order quantity in 
pharmaceutical supply chain. Journal of 
Modelling in Engineering, Vol. 15, No. 
50, (2017c), pp. 245-260. DOI: 
10.22075/JME.2017.2566. 

 
[35] Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., Ebrahimi, S., 

Nami, N., & Ignatius, J. Supply chain 
coordination through lead time crashing in 
a socially responsible supply chain 

considering transportation modes and 
carbon emissions tax. International 
Journal of Transportation Engineering, 
Vol. 6, No. 4, (2018e), pp. 331-354. 

 
[36] Rasti-Barzoki, M., Jafari, H., and Hejazi, 

S. R. Game-Theoretic Approach for 
Pricing Decisions in Dual-Channel Supply 
Chain. International Journal of Industrial 
Engineering and Production 
Research, Vol. 28, No. 1, (2017), pp. 1-8. 

 
[37] Joglekar, P. Comments on “A quantity 

discount pricing model to increase vendor 
profits”. Management science, Vol. 34, 
No. 11, (1988), pp. 1391-1398. 

 
[38] Chen, X., Li, L., & Zhou, M. 

Manufacturer's pricing strategy for supply 
chain with warranty period-dependent 
demand. Omega, Vol. 40, No. 6, (2012), 
pp. 807-816. 

 
[39] Wu, C. H. Price and service competition 

between new and remanufactured products 
in a two-echelon supply 
chain. International Journal of Production 
Economics, Vol. 140, No. 1, (2012), pp. 
496-507. 

 
[40] Vijayan T, Kumaran M  Inventory models 

with a mixture of backorders and lost sales 
under fuzzy cost. European Journal of 
Operational Research, Vol. 189, (2008), 
pp. 105-119. 

 
[41] Ouyang L, Chuang B  A minimax 

distribution free procedure for periodic 
review inventory model involving variable 
lead time. International Journal of Systems 
Science, Vol. 9, (1999), pp. 25-36. 

 
[42] Nouri, M., Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., 

Nematollahi, M., & Sarker, B. R. 
Coordinating manufacturer's innovation 
and retailer's promotion and replenishment 
using a compensation-based wholesale 
price contract. International Journal of 
Production Economics, Vol. 198, (C), 
(2018b), pp. 11-24. 

 



311 Seyyed-Mahdi Hosseini-Motlagh, Mina 
Nouri-Harzvili  & Roza Zirakpourdehkordi 

Two-Level Supply Chain Quality Improvement  
Through a Wholesale Price Coordination Contract  
on Pricing, Quality, and Services 
 

International Journal of Industrial Engineering & Production Research, September 2019, Vol. 30, No. 3                          

[43] Asl-Najafi, J, Yaghoubi,S, and Azaran, A 
Coordination of a Bi-Level Closed-Loop 
Supply Chain considering Economic and 
Green Transportation Modes. 
International Journal of Industrial 
Engineering and Production Research, 
Vol. 29, No. 4, (2018). 

 
[44] Shah, N., and Vaghela, C. Retailer’s 

replenishment and pricing decisions for 
non-instantaneous deterioration and price-
dependent demand. International Journal 
of Industrial Engineering and Production 
Research, Vol. 28, No. 2, (2017), pp. 101-
111. 

 
[45] Esmaeili, P., Rasti-Barzoki, M., and 

Hejazi, R. Pricing and Advertising 
Decisions in a Three-level Supply Chain 
with Nash, Stackelberg and Cooperative 
Games. International Journal of Industrial 
Engineering and Production 
Research, Vol. 27, No. 1, (2016), pp. 43-
59. 

 
[46] Chakraborty, T., Chauhan, S. S., and 

Ouhimmou, M. Cost-sharing mechanism 
for product quality improvement in a 
supply chain under 
competition. International Journal of 
Production Economics, Vol. 208, (2019), 
pp. 566-587. 

 
[47] Angelova, B., and Zekiri, J. Measuring 

customer satisfaction with service quality 
using American Customer Satisfaction 
Model (ACSI Model). International 
Journal of Academic Research in Business 
and Social Sciences, Vol. 1, No. 3, (2011), 
p. 232. 

 
[48] Baghalian, A., Rezapour, S., and Farahani, 

R. Z. Robust supply chain network design 
with service level against disruptions and 
demand uncertainties: A real-life 
case. European Journal of Operational 
Research, Vol. 227, No. 1, (2013), pp. 
199-215. 

 
[49] Li, J. C., Lu, J. H., Wang, Q. L., and Li, C. 

Quality and pricing decisions in a two-
echelon supply chain with Nash 

bargaining fairness concerns. Discrete 
Dynamics in Nature and Society, (2018). 

 
[50] Habibi, B. A., and Tarokh, M. J. Web 

service providers’ game on price and 
service level. International Journal of 
Industrial Engineering and Production 
Research, (2010), pp. 181-195. 

 
[51] Wu, C. H. Price and service competition 

between new and remanufactured products 
in a two-echelon supply 
chain. International Journal of Production 
Economics, Vol. 140, No. 1, (2012), pp. 
496-507. 

 
[52] Dan, B., Zhang, S., and Zhou, M. 

Strategies for warranty service in a dual-
channel supply chain with value-added 
service competition. International Journal 
of Production Research, Vol. 56, No. 17, 
(2018), pp. 5677-5699. 

 
[53] Xia, Y., Xiao, T., and Zhang, G. P. Service 

Investment and Channel Structure 
Decisions in Competing Supply 
Chains. Service Science (2019). 

 
[54] Yuen, E. F., and Chan, S. S. The effect of 

retail service quality and product quality 
on customer loyalty. Journal of Database 
Marketing and Customer Strategy 
Management, Vol. 17, Nos. 3-4, (2010), 
pp. 222-240. 

 
[55] Modak, N. M., Panda, S., and Sana, S. S. 

Managing a two-echelon supply chain 
with price, warranty and quality dependent 
demand. Cogent Business and 
Management, Vol. 2, No. 1, (2015), pp. 
1011-1014. 

 
[56] Tagaras, G., and Vlachos, D. A periodic 

review inventory system with emergency 
replenishments. Management Science. 
Vol. 47, No. 3, (2001), pp. 415-429. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/ j.ejor.2007.05.049. 

 
[57] Sakulsom, N., and Tharmmaphornphilas, 

W. Heuristics for a periodic-review policy 
in a two-echelon inventory problem with 



312 Seyyed-Mahdi Hosseini-Motlagh, Mina Nouri-
Harzvili  & Roza Zirakpourdehkordi 

Two-Level Supply Chain Quality Improvement 
Through a Wholesale Price Coordination Contract on 
Pricing, Quality, and Services 

 

International Journal of Industrial Engineering & Production Research, September 2019, Vol. 30, No. 3                          

seasonal demand. Computers & Industrial 
Engineering (2019). 

 
[58] What are some examples of companies or 

products that have outstanding brand 
equity? June 13, (2019) from Investopedia 
website: https://www.investopedia.com/ 
ask/answers/020915/what-are-some-
examplescompanies-or-products-have-
outstanding-brand-equity.asp. 

 
[59] Nouri-Harzvili, M., Hosseini-Motlagh, S. 

M., and Nematollahi, M. A Mathematical 
Model for Coordinating Decisions in 
Periodic Review Inventory Systems and 
Sharing the Profit in a two-echelon 
Decentralized Supply Chain, by 
Considering Quantity Discount Contract, 
Journal of Industrial Management Studies, 
Vol. 17, No. 52, (2019), pp. 287-338, DOI: 
10.22054/JIMS.2018.17520.1626. 

 
[60] Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M., Nematollahi, M., 

Johari, M., Choi, T.-M. Reverse supply 
chain systems coordination across multiple 
links with duopolistic third party 
collectors.  IEEE Transactions on Systems, 
Man, and Cybernetics: Systems Vol. 3, 

No. 3, (2019), pp. 1-12. 
https://doi.org/10.1109/TSMC.2019.29116
44. 

 
[61] Seyedhosseini, S.M., Hosseini-Motlagh, 

S.-M., Johari, M., Jazinaninejad, M. Social 
Price-sensitivity of demand for 
competitive supply chain coordination, 
Computers and Industrial Engineering 
(2019), 
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.cie.2019.05.019. 

 
[62] Jokar, A., and Hosseini-Motlagh, S. M. 

Simultaneous coordination of order 
quantity and corporate social responsibility 
in a two-echelon supply chain: A 
combined contract approach. Journal of 
the Operational Research Society, (2019), 
pp. 1-16. 

 
[63] Chen, H., Chen, Y. F., Chiu, C. H. Choi, 

T. M., Sethi, S., Coordination mechanism 
for the supply chain with leadtime 
consideration and price-dependent 
demand. European Journal of Operational 
Research, Vol. 203, No. 1, (2010), pp. 70-
80.

 
Follow This Article at The Following Site: 
 
Hosseini-Motlagh S, Nouri-Harzvili M, Zirakpourdehkordi R. Two-level supply 
chain quality improvement through a wholesale price coordination contract on 
pricing, quality and services. IJIEPR. 2019; 30 (3) :287-312 
URL: http://ijiepr.iust.ac.ir/article-1-875-en.html 

 

 

 


